BID TABULATION This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an
award or intent to award to a particular contractor.
Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project

RFB NO: 23-0016 Manager, who will provide an award
DATE: —January 25 2023 recommendation for approval by Columbus
BID: Dumpster/Roll Off Container Rental and Servicing (Annual Contract) Council,
121 Disposal Avery's Dump Duffield Property Waste Management Zero Waste
Vendors Listed Alphabetically: Company, LLC Service Solutions, LLC* Advanced Disposal Solutions
(Auburn, AL) (Shiloh, GA) (Fort Benning, GA) (Columbus, GA) (Concord, CA)
DESCRIPTION EST # OF UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT

CONTAINERS | PRICE COST PRICE PRICE PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST

ALL INCLUSIVE PRICE PER HAUL

15 CUBIC YARD ROLL OFF CONTAINER

1 Cost per Haul (Mon

_ Fri) 4 475.00 $1,900.00 | 275.00 | $1,100.00 597.00 | $2,388.00 | 355.00 | $1,420.00

Cost per Haul (Sat

2 — Sun) 4 500.00 $2,000.00 | 325.00 | $1,300.00 597.00 | $2,388.00 | 405.00 | $1,620.00

30 CUBIC YARD OFF CONTAINER

Cost per haul (

3 | o i 4 510.00 | $2,040.00 . 597.00 | $2,388.00 | 475.00 | $1,900.00

4| S Haul (Sat 4 535.00 | $2,140.00 597.00 | $2,388.00 | 515.00 | $2,060.00
10 YARD DUMPSTER W/ END OPENING CAPABILITIES

3 (_:‘,’:fit)per Haul (Mon 3 440.00 | $1,320.00 | 597.00 | $1,791.00 | 350.00 | $1,050.00

g | Cost per Haul (Sat 3 475.00 | $1,425.00 0P 597.00 | $1,791.00 | 375.00 | $1,125.00

— Sun)

15 YARD DUMPSTER W/ END OPENING CAPABILITIES

7 (_:cl’:srit)pe”"a“' (Mon 3 490.00 | $1,470.00 | 275.00 | $1,100.00 597.00 | $1,791.00 | 375.00 | $1,125.00
8 E%SJnF;erHa“' (Sat 3 51500 |$1,545.00 | 325.00 | $1,300.00 597.00 | $1,791.00 | 415.00 | $1,245.00

30 YARD DUMPSTER W/END OPENING CAPABILITIES

Cost per Haul (Mon

9 ZFri)

3 510.00 $1,530.00 no bid 597.00 $1,791.00 | 495.00 | $1,485.00
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BID TABULATION

TOTAL BID:

$ 7,200.00

$ 33,537.00

121 Disposal Avery's Dump Duffield Property Waste Management Zero Waste
Vendors Listed Alphabetically: Company, LLC Service Solutions, LLC* Advanced Disposal Solutions
(Auburn, AL) (Shiloh, GA) (Fort Benning, GA) (Columbus, GA) (Concord, CA)
DESCRIPTION EST # OF UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT
CONTAINERS PRICE COST PRICE PRICE PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST
10| Sqpe’ Haul (Sat 3 535.00 | $1,605.00 597.00 | $1,791.00 | 510.00 | $1,530.00
COVERED ROLL-OFF, RECYCLING (HOLIDAY SEASON)
11 | SO Haul (Mon 4 $550.00 | $2,200.00 515.00 | $2,060.00
Cost Haul (Sat no bid no bid
12 _%Sun";er aul (Sa 4 $575.00 | $2,300.00 535.00 | $2,140.00
HAUL RATE PER HAU
13 | Haul Cost (Mon — 3 300.00 $900.00 Included in cost 597.00 | $1,791.00 | $250.00 | $ 750.00
14 | Haul Cost (Sat — 3 350.00 $1,050.00 Included in cost 597.00 | $1,791.00 | $275.00 | $ 825.00
15 ?(')Snposa' Cost per 3 48.00 $144.00 Included in cost 35.00 | $105.00 | $40.00 | $120.00
ALTERNATE CONTAINER SIZES
17-Yard cost per
16 haul (Mon - Fri) 4 485.00 $1,940.00 | 275.00 | $1,100.00 597.00 | $2,388.00 | $450.00 | $1,800.00
17-Yard cost per
17 haul (Sat- Sun) 4 525.00 $2,100.00 | 325.00 | $1,300.00 597.00 | $2,388.00 | $500.00 | $2,000.00
20-Yard cost per
18 haul (Mon - Fri) 4 490.00 $1,960.00 597.00 | $2,388.00 | $475.00 | $1,900.00
20-Yard cost per
19 haul (Sat- Sun) 4 515.00 $2,060.00 597.00 | $2,388.00 | $505.00 | $2,020.00

$ 31,629.00

$ 28,175.00

*Bidder response incomplete in DemandStar (no document uploaded).

“No Bid” Response: (None)
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