
BID TABULATION

Vendor Name:

(Listed alphabetically, as 

shown in DemandStar)

Central Turf & 

Irrigation Supply 

(Columbus, GA)

1 
Helena Agri-

Enterprises

(Suwanee, GA)

Heritage 

Landscape 

Supply Group, 

Inc.

(McKinney, TX)

1 
Howard Fertilizer 

and Chemical

(Dallas, TX)

Opterra Solutions, 

Inc.

(Lexington, SC)

Orion Solutions, LLC

(Rocky Mount, VA)

2 
SiteOne 

Landscape Supply

(Cleveland, OH)

Southern States 

Cooperative

(Cartersville, GA)

U.S. Ag Fertilizer

(Hogansville, GA)

Total, Park Services  $       289,878.79 330,322.77$     321,533.28$       162,388.50$            290,303.95$       3,552.00$            

Total, Public Works  $       145,345.70 174,195.04$     196,387.88$       83,925.50$               140,331.30$       19,536.00$          

VENDOR TOTAL BID 435,224.49$        504,517.81$     517,921.16$       246,314.00$            430,635.25$       23,088.00$          

1 No Bid line 9 No Bid Lines 13 No Bid Lines 23 No Bid Lines All Lines Bid 50 No Bid Lines

RFB NO:  24-0002

BID:  Agricultural Chemicals (Annual Contract)

DATE:  August 9, 2023

PLEASE REFER TO FOLLOWING PAGES FOR LINE ITEM PRICING

1
 Submissions from both Helena Agri-Enterprises and Howard Fertilizer and Chemical did not include the most recently revised pricing pages, a bid submission requirement.

2
 Submission from SiteOne Landscape Supply did not include Form 2 - Communication Concerning this Solicitation, a bid submission requirement. 

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent 
to award to a particular contractor.  Bid responses are being 
forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an 
award recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.
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BID TABULATION

Product

Name
Active Ingredients

Est. 

Qty.

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

1

Three Way Selective Herbicide or 

Equivalent

Selective herbicide Dimethylamine Salt of 2.4 

Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid 30.56%; Dimethylamine 

salt of (+) R-2-(2-Methyl-4 Chlorophenoxy propionic 

Acid 8.1% Dimethylamine salt of Dicamba (3, 6-

Dichloro-o-anisic Acid) 2.77%

500 Gals 250 Gal  $  8,000.00  $    16,000.00 
2.5

GAL
 $     191.92  $  38,384.00 2.5 Gal 73.13$        14,626.00$     

2 Three-Way Ester II or Equivalent

Isooctyl (2-ethylhexyl) Ester of 2-Methyl-4-

Chlorophenoxyacetic  Acid* 56.14%;  Butoxyethanol 

Ester of 3,5,6-Trichloro-2-Pyridinyloxyacetic Acid** 

5.00%; Dicamba (3,6-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid)*** 

3.60%

30 Cs 2.5 Gal  $     214.75  $    12,885.00 
2.5

GAL
 $     244.56  $  14,673.60 5 Gal 513.50$      15,405.00$     

3
Chelated Iron Plus 12-0-0 or 

Equivalent

Urea nitrogen 12%, sulfur 4%, chelated iron 6%, 

chelated manganese 2% 5 Gals 2.5 Gal  $       33.00  $           66.00 
2.5 

GAL
 $       22.28  $         44.56 2.5 Gal 70.00$        70.00$            

4 Pellitized Lime or Equivalent 120 Bags 50 Lb  $         7.50  $         900.00 50 Lb  $       11.43  $    1,371.60 40 Lb 8.95$          1,074.00$       

5 Revolver or Equivalent Foramsulfuron 2.34% 30 Cs 1 Qt  $     329.28  $    39,513.60 1QT  $     282.90  $  33,948.00 4x87 Oz 3,280.00$   98,400.00$     

6 Pre-m 0.86% 0-0-7 or Equivalent
Pendimethalin 0.86% Plus Fertilizer

700 Bags 50 Lb  $       15.00  $    10,500.00 50 Lb  $       12.20  $    8,540.00 50 Lb 17.75$        12,425.00$     

7
Pre-m 3.3 EC 0.86% 0-0-7 or 

Equivalent

Pendimethalin….. 37.4% Liquid 
100 Gal 2.5 Gal  $     180.00  $      7,200.00 

2.5

GAL
 $       98.55  $    3,942.00  NO BID 

8 Pre-m 0.86% 25-2-5 or Equivalent
Pendimethalin 0.86% Plus Fertilizer

700 Bags 50 Lb  $       26.65  $    18,655.00 
50

LB
 $       28.26  $  19,782.00 50 Lb 23.25$        16,275.00$     

9 24-2-11 or Equivalent
Fertilizer, 40% poly plus sulfer coated urea 6% Fe 1200 

Bags
50 Lb  $       20.96  $    25,152.00 

50

LB
 $       29.82  $  35,784.00 50 Lb 23.00$        27,600.00$     

Vendor Name:

(Listed alphabetically, as shown in DemandStar)

Central Turf & Irrigation Supply 

(Columbus, GA)

AGRICULTURAL CHEMICALS 

(ANNUAL CONTRACT)

RFB NO. 24-0002

Opterra Solutions, Inc.

(Lexington, SC)

Park Services

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, 

Inc.

(McKinney, TX)

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent 
to award to a particular contractor.  Bid responses are being 
forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an 
award recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.
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BID TABULATION

Product

Name
Active Ingredients

Est. 

Qty.

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Vendor Name:

(Listed alphabetically, as shown in DemandStar)

Central Turf & Irrigation Supply 

(Columbus, GA)

Opterra Solutions, Inc.

(Lexington, SC)

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, 

Inc.

(McKinney, TX)

10 18-24-12 or Equivalent
25% poly plus sulfur coated urea

20 Bags 50 Lb  $       21.54  $         430.80 
50

LB
 $       31.00  $       620.00 50 Lb 21.25$        425.00$          

11 20-1-5 or Equivalent
Organic Fertilizer

20 Bags 50 Lb  $       19.20  $         384.00 
50

LB
 $       18.40  $       368.00 50 Lb 13.45$        269.00$          

12 25-5-11 or Equivalent
Organic Fertilizer 1200 

Bags
50 Lb  $       23.49  $    28,188.00 

50

LB
 $       26.02  $  31,224.00 50 Lb 13.00$        15,600.00$     

13 5-10-15 or Equivalent 120 Bags 50 Lb  $       15.95  $      1,914.00 NO BID    50 lb 13.45$        1,614.00$       

14 Dolimitic Lime or Equivalent 360 Bags 50 Lb  $         8.14  $      2,930.40 
50

LB 
 $       11.43  $    4,114.80 40 Lb 7.25$          2,610.00$       

15 Garlon *3A or Equivalent
Triclopyr 44.4%

100 Gals 2.5 Gal  $     136.00  $      5,440.00 
2.5

GAL
 $     182.05  $    7,282.00 2.5 Gal 118.00$      4,720.00$       

16 Manicure 6FL or Equivalent
Chlorothalonil 54.0%

25 Gals 2.5  $       92.00  $         920.00 
2.5

GAL
 $       66.15  $       661.50 2.5 Gal 90.85$        908.50$          

17 Top Choice Insecticide or Equivalent
Fipronil 0.0143%

100 Bags 30 Lb  $       44.00  $      4,400.00 50 Lb  $       94.15  $    9,415.00 1 Bag 91.00$        9,100.00$       

18 Simazine 4L or Equivalent
Simazine 42.1%

100 Gals 2.5 Gal  $       76.00  $      3,040.00 
2.5 

GAL
 $       67.92 $2,716.80 2.5 Gal 89.70$        3,588.00$       

19
Reward Landscape/ Aquatic herbicide 

or Equivalent

Diquat 37.3%
20 Gals 1 Gal  $       74.59  $      1,491.80 

2.5 

GAL
 $     240.00  $    1,920.00 2.5 Gal 282.35$      2,258.80$       

20 Spectacle 20 Gals 1 Gal  $  1,743.50  $    34,870.00 1 GAL  $  2,031.20  $  40,624.00 1 Gal 2,031.20$   40,624.00$     

21 Foam Marker Foam 100% 15 Gals 1 Gal  $       31.25  $         468.75 1 QT  $       11.41  $       684.60 1 Gal 37.00$        555.00$          

22 Primo Maxx or Equivalent
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%

20 Gals 2.5 Gal  $     312.33  $      2,498.64 1 GAL  $     317.00  $    6,340.00 1 Gal 353.00$      7,060.00$       

23 Rodeo or Equivalent
Glyphosate (for aquatic vegetation)

200 Gals 30 Gal  $     625.00  $      4,375.00 
2.5 

GAL
 $       57.79  $    4,623.20 2.5 Gal 70.35$        5,628.00$       

24 Roundup Quick Pro or Equivalent Glyphosate 73.3%; Diquat dibromide 2.9% 200 Lbs 6.8 Lb  $     124.95  $      3,748.50 
2.5 

GAL
 $       85.86  $  17,172.00 6.8 Lb 122.40$      3,600.00$       

25 Lesco-Fate or Equivalent Acephate 75.0% 5 Lbs 5 Lb  $       72.00  $           72.00 NO BID  NO BID 

26 UP-Star Gold or Equivalent Bifenthrin 7.9% 50 Gals 1 Gal  $       38.89  $      1,944.50 1 GAL  $       43.28  $    2,164.00 1 Gal 44.00$        2,200.00$       

27 Headline or Equivalent Pyraclostrobin 23.6% 2 Gals 1 Gal  $     270.00  $         540.00 NO BID  NO BID 

28 Dimension Ultra or Equivalent Dithiopyr 40% 200 Oz 1 Gal  $     200.00  $         400.00 
2.5 

GAL
 $       53.80  $       269.00  NO BID 

29 Manor 60DF or Equivalent Metasulfuron 60.0% 50 Oz 8 Oz  $       40.00  $         280.00 2 OZ  $       24.58  $       614.50 16 Oz 43.36$        135.50$          
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BID TABULATION

Product

Name
Active Ingredients

Est. 

Qty.

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Vendor Name:

(Listed alphabetically, as shown in DemandStar)

Central Turf & Irrigation Supply 

(Columbus, GA)

Opterra Solutions, Inc.

(Lexington, SC)

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, 

Inc.

(McKinney, TX)

30 Sedge Hammer or Equivalent
Halosulfuron-Methyl 75.0%

80 Oz 1.33 Oz  $       62.00  $      3,782.00 
1.33 

OZ
 $       58.80  $    4,704.00 1.3 Oz 68.25$        4,200.00$       

31 Monument 75WG or Equivalent
Trifloxysulfuron-sodium 75.0%

20 Oz
25 

Grams
 $     275.00  $      6,325.00 25 GM  $     300.00  $    6,792.00  NO BID 

32 Drive 75DF or Equivalent Quinclorac 75% 100 Lbs 1Lb  $       45.00  $      4,500.00 1 LB  $       63.04  $    6,304.00 1 Lb 52.00$        5,200.00$       

33 Celsius WG
Thiencarbazone-methyl 8.7%; Iodosulfuron-methyl-s 

1.9%; Dicamba 57.4%
100 Lbs 10 Oz  $     125.80  $    20,128.00 10 OZ  $  1,006.40  $  20,128.00 10 Oz 140.00$      22,400.00$     

34 Crosscheck Plus Liquid, 7.9% bifenthrin 300 Gals 30 Gal  $  1,347.66  $    13,476.60  NO BID  NO BID 

35 Crosscheck Plus Granular, .2% bifenthrin 300 Lbs 25 Lbs  $       19.00  $         228.00  NO BID  NO BID 

36 Liquid Iron 50 Gals 2.5 Gal  $       34.00  $         680.00 55 GAL  $     409.51  $       409.51  NO BID 

37 Spreader Sticker/Surfectant 20 Gals 1 Gal  $       35.00  $         700.00  NO BID 2.5 Gal 32.81$        262.48$          

38 Spray Tank Cleaner 50 Gals 1 Gal  $       21.00  $      1,050.00 1 GAL  $         9.77  $       488.50  NO BID 

39 Sevin 4F or Equivalent
Carbaryl 43.0%

100 Gals 2.5 Gal  $     130.00  $      5,200.00 
2.5 

GAL
 $       55.97  $    2,238.80  NO BID 

40 Spray Dye, Tracker Blue 2.5 Gal 100 Gals 2.5 Gal  $     115.03  $      4,601.20 
2.5 

GAL
 $       49.37  $    1,974.80 2.5 Gal 67.50$        2,700.00$       

1 Three Way Selective Herbicide

Selective herbicide Dimethylamine Salt of 2.4 

Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid 30.56%; Dimethylamine 

salt of (+) R-2-(2-Methyl-4 Chlorophenoxy propionic 

Acid 8.1% Dimethylamine salt of Dicamba (3, 6-

Dichloro-o-anisic Acid) 2.77%

500 Gals
 250 

Gal 
 $  8,000.00  $    16,000.00 

2.5

GAL
 $     191.92  $  38,384.00 2.5 Gal 73.13$        14,626.00$     

2 Chelated Iron Plus 12-0-0
Urea nitrogen 12%, sulfur 4%, chelated iron 6%, 

chelated manganese 2%
5 Gals  2.5 Gal  $       34.00  $           68.00 

2.5

GAL
 $       22.28  $         44.56 2.5 Gal 35.00$        70.00$            

3 Induce 50 Gals  2.5 Gal  $       67.48  $      1,349.60  NO BID 2.5 Gal 33.28$        665.60$          

4 Herbicide, Three-Way Ester II 30 Cs  2.5 Gal  $     214.75  $    12,885.00 
2.5

GAL
 $     244.56  $  14,673.60 5 Gal 513.50$      15,405.00$     

5 Herbicide, Revolver 30 Cs  1 Qt  $     329.28  $    39,513.60 1QT  $     282.90  $  33,948.00 4x87 Oz 3,280.00$   98,400.00$     

PUBLIC WORKS

Total, Park Services  $                                      289,878.79 321,533.28$                                             330,322.77$                                     
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BID TABULATION

Product

Name
Active Ingredients

Est. 

Qty.

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Vendor Name:

(Listed alphabetically, as shown in DemandStar)

Central Turf & Irrigation Supply 

(Columbus, GA)

Opterra Solutions, Inc.

(Lexington, SC)

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, 

Inc.

(McKinney, TX)

6 Fertilizer, Lime Pellitized 120 Bags  50Lb  $         7.50  $         900.00 50 LB  $       11.43  $    1,371.60  NO BID 

7 Fertilizer, Mulch 70/30 80 Bags  NO BID  NO BID     NO BID 

8 Target 6.6 (MSMA)
Monosodium Acid Methanearsonate (MSMA) 51.0%

10 Gals  2.5 Gal  $     113.10  $         452.40 
2.5 

GAL
 $       81.92  $       327.68 2.5 Gal 105.00$      420.00$          

9 24-2-11
Fertilizer, 40% poly plus sulfer coated urea 6% Fe 1,200 

Bags
 50 Lb  $       20.96  $    25,152.00 50 LB  $       29.82  $  35,784.00 50 Lb 23.00$        27,600.00$     

10 Pre-m 0.86% 0-0-7
Pendimethalin 0.86% Fertilizer

700 Bags  50 Lb  $       15.00  $    10,500.00 50 LB  $       12.20  $    8,540.00 50 Lb 17.75$        12,425.00$     

11 Pre-m 0.86% 25-2-5
Pendimethalin 0.86%

700 Bags  50 Lb  $       26.65  $    18,655.00  $       28.26  $  19,782.00 50 Lb 23.25$        16,275.00$     

12 Roundup Quick Pro
Glyphosate 73.3%; Diquat dibromide 2.9%

200 Gals  6.8 Lb  $     124.95  $      3,748.50 
2.5 

GAL
 $       85.86  $    6,868.80  NO BID 

13 Rodeo
Glyphosate (for aquatic vegetation)

200 Gals  2.5 Gal  $     125.00  $    10,000.00 
2.5 

GAL
 $       57.79  $    4,623.20 2.5 Gal 70.35$        5,628.00$       

14 Fertilizer, 13-13-13 120 Bags  50 Lb  $       12.48  $      1,497.60 50 LB  $       17.95  $    2,154.00 50 Lb 16.55$        1,986.00$       

15 Spreader Sticker/ Surfectant 20 Gals  2.5 Gal  $       48.00  $         384.00  NO BID 2.5 Gal 32.81$        262.48$          

16 Aquatic Adjuvant Non-Ionic Surfectant 200 Gals  2.5 Gal  $       53.00  $      4,240.00 
2.5 

GAL
 $       96.17  $    7,693.60 2.5 Gal 32.81$        2,624.80$       

517,921.16$                                             

196,387.88$                                              $                                      145,345.70 

VENDOR TOTAL BID 435,224.49$                                       504,517.81$                                     

174,195.04$                                     Total, Public Works
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BID TABULATION

Product

Name
Active Ingredients

Est. 

Qty.

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

1

Three Way Selective Herbicide or 

Equivalent

Selective herbicide Dimethylamine Salt of 2.4 

Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid 30.56%; Dimethylamine 

salt of (+) R-2-(2-Methyl-4 Chlorophenoxy propionic 

Acid 8.1% Dimethylamine salt of Dicamba (3, 6-

Dichloro-o-anisic Acid) 2.77%

500 

Gals
2.5 Gal 78.75$           15,750.00$   2.5 Gal 76.25$        15,250.00$    NO BID 

2 Three-Way Ester II or Equivalent

Isooctyl (2-ethylhexyl) Ester of 2-Methyl-4-

Chlorophenoxyacetic  Acid* 56.14%;  Butoxyethanol 

Ester of 3,5,6-Trichloro-2-Pyridinyloxyacetic Acid** 

5.00%; Dicamba (3,6-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid)*** 

3.60%

30 Cs 2.5 Gal 260.925$       15,655.50$   2.5 Gal 232.50$      13,950.00$    NO BID 

3
Chelated Iron Plus 12-0-0 or 

Equivalent

Urea nitrogen 12%, sulfur 4%, chelated iron 6%, 

chelated manganese 2% 5 Gals  NO BID 2.5 Gal 51.25$        102.50$         NO BID 

4 Pellitized Lime or Equivalent
120 

Bags
 NO BID 50 Lb 5.47$          656.40$        5 Gal 59.00$     59.00$          

5 Revolver or Equivalent Foramsulfuron 2.34% 30 Cs 1 Qt 342.00$         41,040.00$   32 Oz 299.50$      35,940.00$    NO BID 

6 Pre-m 0.86% 0-0-7 or Equivalent
Pendimethalin 0.86% Plus Fertilizer 700 

Bags
 NO BID 50 Lb 15.52$        10,864.00$    NO BID 

7
Pre-m 3.3 EC 0.86% 0-0-7 or 

Equivalent

Pendimethalin….. 37.4% Liquid 100 

Gal
 NO BID 2.5 Gal 127.30$      5,092.00$      NO BID 

8 Pre-m 0.86% 25-2-5 or Equivalent
Pendimethalin 0.86% Plus Fertilizer 700 

Bags
 NO BID 50 Lb 22.82$        15,974.00$    NO BID 

9 24-2-11 or Equivalent
Fertilizer, 40% poly plus sulfer coated urea 6% Fe 1200 

Bags
 NO BID 50 Lb 19.97$        23,964.00$    NO BID 

U.S. Ag Fertilizer

(Hogansville, GA)

Southern States Cooperative

(Cartersville, GA)

Orion Solutions, LLC

(Rocky Mount, VA)

Vendor Name, CONTINUED:

(Listed alphabetically, as shown in DemandStar)

Park Services
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BID TABULATION

Product

Name
Active Ingredients

Est. 

Qty.

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

U.S. Ag Fertilizer

(Hogansville, GA)

Southern States Cooperative

(Cartersville, GA)

Orion Solutions, LLC

(Rocky Mount, VA)

Vendor Name, CONTINUED:

(Listed alphabetically, as shown in DemandStar)

10 18-24-12 or Equivalent
25% poly plus sulfur coated urea 20 

Bags
 NO BID 50 Lb 21.25$        425.00$         NO BID 

11 20-1-5 or Equivalent
Organic Fertilizer 20 

Bags
 NO BID 40 Lb 13.10$        262.00$         NO BID 

12 25-5-11 or Equivalent
Organic Fertilizer 1200 

Bags
 NO BID 50 Lb 16.87$        20,244.00$    NO BID 

13 5-10-15 or Equivalent 120 Bags  NO BID 50 Lb 12.51$        1,501.20$      NO BID 

14 Dolimitic Lime or Equivalent 360 Bags  NO BID 50 Lb 5.47$          1,969.20$     5 Gal 59.00$     177.00$        

15 Garlon *3A or Equivalent
Triclopyr 44.4%

100 Gals 2.5 Gal 125.625$       5,025.00$     2.5 Gal 197.50$      7,900.00$      NO BID 

16 Manicure 6FL or Equivalent
Chlorothalonil 54.0%

25 Gals 2.5 Gal 82.50$           825.00$        2.5 Gal 81.85$        818.50$         NO BID 

17 Top Choice Insecticide or Equivalent
Fipronil 0.0143%

100 Bags 30 Lb 51.40$           5,140.00$     50 Lb 90.75$        9,075.00$      NO BID 

18 Simazine 4L or Equivalent
Simazine 42.1%

100 Gals  NO BID 2.5 Gal 70.60$        2,824.00$      NO BID 

19
Reward Landscape/ Aquatic herbicide 

or Equivalent

Diquat 37.3%
20 Gals 2.5 180.00$         1,440.00$     2.5 Gal 240.00$      1,920.00$      NO BID 

20 Spectacle 20 Gals 1 Gal 1,898.25$      37,965.00$   1 Gal 1,753.50$   35,070.00$    NO BID 

21 Foam Marker Foam 100% 15 Gals  NO BID 1 Gal 36.00$        540.00$         NO BID 

22 Primo Maxx or Equivalent
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%

20 Gals  NO BID 1 Gal 125.00$      2,500.00$      NO BID 

23 Rodeo or Equivalent
Glyphosate (for aquatic vegetation)

200 Gals 2.5 73.75$           5,900.00$     2.5 Gal 95.00$        7,600.00$      NO BID 

24 Roundup Quick Pro or Equivalent Glyphosate 73.3%; Diquat dibromide 2.9% 200 Lbs 6.8 Lb 99.00$           2,970.00$     6.8 Lb 123.00$      3,690.00$      NO BID 

25 Lesco-Fate or Equivalent Acephate 75.0% 5 Lbs  NO BID 1 Lb 9.16$          45.80$           NO BID 

26 UP-Star Gold or Equivalent Bifenthrin 7.9% 50 Gals 1 Gal 55.98$           2,799.00$     1 Gal 55.50$        2,775.00$      NO BID 

27 Headline or Equivalent Pyraclostrobin 23.6% 2 Gals  NO BID 2.5 Gal 3,612.55$   3,612.55$      NO BID 

28 Dimension Ultra or Equivalent Dithiopyr 40% 200 Oz 5 Oz 22.50$           900.00$        5 Oz 134.50$      5,380.00$      NO BID 

29 Manor 60DF or Equivalent Metasulfuron 60.0% 50 Oz  NO BID 8 Oz 24.00$        144.00$         NO BID 
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BID TABULATION

Product

Name
Active Ingredients

Est. 

Qty.

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

U.S. Ag Fertilizer

(Hogansville, GA)

Southern States Cooperative

(Cartersville, GA)

Orion Solutions, LLC

(Rocky Mount, VA)

Vendor Name, CONTINUED:

(Listed alphabetically, as shown in DemandStar)

30 Sedge Hammer or Equivalent
Halosulfuron-Methyl 75.0%

80 Oz  NO BID 1.33 Oz 65.00$        3,900.00$      NO BID 

31 Monument 75WG or Equivalent
Trifloxysulfuron-sodium 75.0%

20 Oz  NO BID 8.81 Oz 300.00$      600.00$         NO BID 

32 Drive 75DF or Equivalent Quinclorac 75% 100 Lbs 1 Lb 58.75$           5,992.50$     1 Lb 45.63$        4,563.00$      NO BID 

33 Celsius WG
Thiencarbazone-methyl 8.7%; Iodosulfuron-methyl-s 

1.9%; Dicamba 57.4%
100 Lbs  NO BID 10 Oz 125.80$      20,128.00$    NO BID 

34 Crosscheck Plus Liquid, 7.9% bifenthrin 300 Gals 1 Gal 55.98$           16,794.00$   1 Gal 55.50$        16,650.00$    NO BID 

35 Crosscheck Plus Granular, .2% bifenthrin 300 Lbs  NO BID 25 Lb 21.00$        252.00$         NO BID 

36 Liquid Iron 50 Gals  NO BID 2.5 Gal 24.37$        487.40$         NO BID 

37 Spreader Sticker/Surfectant 20 Gals 2.5 Gal 25.625$         205.00$        2.5 Gal 44.05$        352.40$        5 Gal 444.00$   1,776.00$     

38 Spray Tank Cleaner 50 Gals 2.5 Gal 48.125$         962.50$        1 Gal 39.00$        1,950.00$     5 Gal 154.00$   1,540.00$     

39 Sevin 4F or Equivalent
Carbaryl 43.0%

100 Gals  NO BID 2.5 Gal 184.30$      7,372.00$      NO BID 

40 Spray Dye, Tracker Blue 2.5 Gal 100 Gals 2.5 Gal 75.625$         3,025.00$     2.5 Gal 99.00$        3,960.00$      NO BID 

1 Three Way Selective Herbicide

Selective herbicide Dimethylamine Salt of 2.4 

Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid 30.56%; Dimethylamine 

salt of (+) R-2-(2-Methyl-4 Chlorophenoxy propionic 

Acid 8.1% Dimethylamine salt of Dicamba (3, 6-

Dichloro-o-anisic Acid) 2.77%

500 Gals 2.5 Gal 78.75$           15,750.00$   2.5 Gal 76.25$        15,250.00$    NO BID 

2 Chelated Iron Plus 12-0-0
Urea nitrogen 12%, sulfur 4%, chelated iron 6%, 

chelated manganese 2%
5 Gals  NO BID 2.5 Gal 51.25$        102.50$         NO BID 

3 Induce 50 Gals  NO BID 2.5 Gal 69.10$        1,382.00$      NO BID 

4 Herbicide, Three-Way Ester II 30 Cs 2.5 Gal 260.925$       15,655.50$   2.5 Gal 232.50$      13,950.00$    NO BID 

5 Herbicide, Revolver 30 Cs 1 Qt 342.00$         41,040.00$   32 Oz 299.50$      35,940.00$    NO BID 

3,552.00$                                      290,303.95$                                        162,388.50$                                             Total, Park Services

PUBLIC WORKS
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BID TABULATION

Product

Name
Active Ingredients

Est. 

Qty.

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Size

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

U.S. Ag Fertilizer

(Hogansville, GA)

Southern States Cooperative

(Cartersville, GA)

Orion Solutions, LLC

(Rocky Mount, VA)

Vendor Name, CONTINUED:

(Listed alphabetically, as shown in DemandStar)

6 Fertilizer, Lime Pellitized 120 Bags  NO BID 50 Lb 5.47$          656.40$         NO BID 

7 Fertilizer, Mulch 70/30 80 Bags  NO BID 50 Lb 23.90$        1,912.00$      NO BID 

8 Target 6.6 (MSMA)
Monosodium Acid Methanearsonate (MSMA) 51.0%

10 Gals 2.5 Gal  $          88.75 355.00$        2.5 Gal 95.00$        380.00$         NO BID 

9 24-2-11
Fertilizer, 40% poly plus sulfer coated urea 6% Fe

1,200 Bags  NO BID 50 Lb 19.97$        23,964.00$    NO BID 

10 Pre-m 0.86% 0-0-7
Pendimethalin 0.86% Fertilizer

700 Bags  NO BID 50 Lb 15.52$        10,864.00$    NO BID 

11 Pre-m 0.86% 25-2-5
Pendimethalin 0.86%

700 Bags  NO BID 50 Lb 22.82$        15,974.00$    NO BID 

12 Roundup Quick Pro
Glyphosate 73.3%; Diquat dibromide 2.9%

200 Gals 6.8 Lb 99.00$           2,970.00$     6.8 Lb 123.00$      3,690.00$      NO BID 

13 Rodeo
Glyphosate (for aquatic vegetation)

200 Gals 2.5 Gal 73.75$           5,900.00$     2.5 Gal 95.00$        7,600.00$      NO BID 

14 Fertilizer, 13-13-13 120 Bags  NO BID 50 Lb 15.95$        1,914.00$      NO BID 

15 Spreader Sticker/ Surfectant 20 Gals 2.5 Gal 25.625$         205.00$        2.5 Gal 44.05$        352.40$        
5 Gal 444.00$   1,776.00$     

16 Aquatic Adjuvant Non-Ionic Surfectant 200 Gals 2.5 Gal 25.625$         2,050.00$     1 Gal 32 6,400.00$     
5 Gal 444.00$   17,760.00$   

19,536.00$                                    

23,088.00$                                    

140,331.30$                                        

430,635.25$                                        246,314.00$                                             

83,925.50$                                               Total, Public Works

VENDOR TOTAL BID
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