BID TABULATION

RFB NO: 24-0004

DATE: September 6, 2023

BID: Trophies and Other Miscellaneous Awards
(Annual Contract)

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or
intent to award to a particular contractor. Bid
responses are being forwarded to the Project
Manager, who  will provide an  award
recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Columbus Fire & Safety

Equipment d/b/a
Columbus Trophy
& Screenprint
(Columbus, GA)

G.E.W. Inc. d/b/a Wade
Linen Service
(Columbus, GA)?

Promo Solutions
(Frisco, TX)?

Trophies/Plaques/Awards $74,530.00 $103,512.00 No Bid
Screen Printed T-Shirts $27,572.00 $32,864.69 $23,700.95
Grand Total $102,102.00 $ 136,376.69 $ 23,700.95
Additional Embroidery Services $10 - $15 $5.50 - $8.50 $20 - $30
Normal Delivery Within 5 Days 15 Days 21 Days
. L Yes, for an
Next Day Delivery (within 24 hours) Yes No additional fee
Percent Discount for non-listed items 30% 5% 20%

1 Vendor did not include a signed Form 7 — Conflict of Interest Affidavit, a bid submission

requirement.

2Vendor did not include a signed Form 3 — Communication Concerning this Solicitation and Form 7 —
Conflict of Interest Affidavit, a bid submission requirement.

“No Bid” Response:
1. Mazz, Inc. d/b/a Midwest Swiss Embroideries
2. Suburban Custom Awards and Framing

(REFER TO FOLLOWING PAGES FOR LINE ITEM TABULATION)
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RFB NO: 24-0004

BID TABULATION

DATE: September 6, 2023
BID: Trophies and Other Miscellaneous Awards (Annual Contract)
Columbus Trophy and G.E.W., Inc. d/b{a Wade Linen Promo Solutions
VENDOR NAME: Screenprint Service (Frisco, TX)
(Columbus, GA) (Columbus, GA) ’
Unit Ext Unit Ext Unit Ext
DESCRIPTION Est Qty Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost
I. Trophies — 2-Post
1{1* Place — 28 20 $ 2000 (% 400.00 | $ 35.00|$ 700.00
2[2" Place — 26” 20 $ 19.00 [$ 380.00 | $ 3200 [ $ 640.00 No Bid
3|3 Place — 24” 15 $ 18.00 (% 270.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 450.00
Sub-Total| $ 1,050.00| $ 1,790.00
I1. Trophies — 3 &4 Post w/Sublimated billboard on bottom
4{1* Place — 40” 150 $ 53.00 (% 7,950.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 8,250.00
5/2" Place — 38” 150 $ 49.00 ($ 7,350.00 | $ 52.00 | $ 7,800.00 No Bid
6/3" Place — 36” 150 $ 4700 |$% 7,050.00 | $ 50.00 [ $ 7,500.00
Sub-Total| $ 22,350.00| $ 23,550.00
I11. Trophies — Tombstone w/2 colors
7[1% Place — 197 123 $ 53.00 (% 6,519.00 | $ 30.00 [ $ 3,690.00
8/2" Place — 177 123 $ 5100 % 6,273.00 | $ 28.00 [ $ 3,444.00
9(3" Place — 15” 120 $ 50.00 ($ 6,000.00 | $ 26.00 [ $ 3,120.00 No Bid
10| Trophy Display Cases 2 $ 100.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 90.00 [ $ 180.00
Sub-Total| $ 18,992.00] $ 10,434.00
IV. Trophies — Resin w/sublimated plates on bottom w/logos
Minimum 4” Tall and Maximum 10 %" Tall
11 4" 200 $ 10.00 [$ 2,000.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 5,000.00
12 5" 100 $ 1100 (% 1,100.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 2,800.00
13 6" 100 $ 1200 ($ 1,200.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 3,200.00
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BID TABULATION

Columbus Trophy and G.E.W., Inc. d/b{a Wade Linen Promo Solutions
VENDOR NAME: Screenprint Service (Frisco, TX)
(Columbus, GA) (Columbus, GA) ’
Unit Ext Unit Ext Unit Ext
DESCRIPTION Est Qty Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost
14 7 100 |$ 13.00($ 1,300.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 3,500.00 No Bid
15 8" 100 |$ 1400 ($ 1,400.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 4,000.00
16 9" 100 |$ 1500 ($ 1,500.00 | $ 45.00 [ $ 4,500.00
17 10.5" 45 $ 16.00 [$ 720.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 2,250.00
Sub-Total| $ 9,220.00] $ 25,250.00
V. Medals w/Neck Ribbons w/Engraving
18|Minimum 1 %” and Maximum 2 %" 150 |$ 650 ($ 975.00 | $ 550 $ 825.00
19|Medallion Holders — Plastic or Resin 150 $ 650(9 975.00 | $ 5501$% 825.00 No Bid
Sub-Total| $ 1,950.00| $ 1,650.00
V1. Acrylic Awards w/CP&R Engraved Logos
Minimum 4” and Maximum 12”
20 4" 45 $ 2000 (% 900.00 | $ 12.00 [ $ 540.00
21 5" 40 $ 21.00($ 840.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 600.00
22 6" 38 $ 2300 (% 874.00 | $ 18.00 [ $ 684.00
23 7 37 $ 2400 |% 888.00 | $ 2200 [ $ 814.00
24 8" 37 $ 2500 (% 925.00 | $ 25.001$ 925.00 No Bid
25 9" 37 $ 26.00|% 962.00 | $ 30.00 [ $ 1,110.00
26 10" 37 $ 2800 (% 1,036.00 | $ 35.00 [ $ 1,295.00
27 11" 37 $ 29.00 |$ 1,073.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 1,480.00
28 12" 37 $ 3000 (% 1,110.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 1,665.00
Sub-Total| $ 8,608.00] $ 9,113.00
VI11. Various Plaque Sublimated
29|14 x 6 10 $ 800($ 80.00 | $ 20.75$ 207.50
30|5x7 400 |$ 10.00 |$ 4,000.00 | $ 21.75 1 $ 8,700.00
31|16 x 8 10 $ 1200 ($ 120.00 | $ 3250 [ $ 325.00
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BID TABULATION

Columbus Trophy and G.E.W., Inc. d/b{a Wade Linen Promo Solutions
VENDOR NAME: Screenprint Service (Frisco, TX)
(Columbus, GA) (Columbus, GA)
Unit Ext Unit Ext Unit Ext
DESCRIPTION Est Qty Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost
32|7x9 10 $ 1400 (% 140.00 | $ 36.25$ 362.50
33|18 x 10 400 |$ 16.00 [$ 6,400.00 | $ 30.25 | $12,100.00
34|9x 12 10 $ 18.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 50.00 [ $ 500.00 No Bid
35|10 %2 x 13 10 $ 2100 (% 210.00 | $ 57.00 | $ 570.00
36|12 x 15 10 $ 23.00 (% 230.00 | $ 67.00 [ $ 670.00
37|15x 18 10 $ 3000 (% 300.00 | $ 298.00 | $ 2,980.00
38[16 x 24 10 $ 3500 (% 350.00 | $ 311.00 [ $ 3,110.00
39(Solid Walnut Plaque — By Request from 10 $ 3500 (% 350.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 2,200.00
Sub-Total| $ 12,360.00] $ 31,725.00
Sub-Total: Trophies, etc.| $ 74,530.00| $ 103,512.00 N/A
VIII. Screen Printed T-Shirts — Various Sizes
A. Short Sleeve T-Shirts - Youth
40|Small — Medium — Large 200 |$ 6.00($ 1,200.00 | $ 769 |% 1538.00]% 5.75| $1,150.00
41|X-Large 200 |$ 6.00($% 1,200.00 | $ 7691% 1538.00|% 5.75|$1,150.00
B. Short Sleeve T-Shirts - Adult
42|Small — Medium — Large 20 $ 650(% 130.00 | $ 769]|% 15380|% 595|% 119.00
43| X-Large 480 |$ 650 (9% 3,120.00 | $ 769 |% 3,691.20]$ 5.95| $2,856.00
44|2X-Large 350 |$ 8.00($ 2,800.00 | $ 9.69|% 339150 |$ 6.75| $2,362.50
45|3X-Large 150 |$ 950 ($ 1,425.00 | $ 1169 [ $ 1,75350]$ 8.25]| $1,237.50
C. Long Sleeve T-Shirts - Youth
46|Small — Medium — Large 100 |$ 1000 ($ 1,000.00 | $ 1189 [ $ 1,189.00]$ 855|$ 855.00
47|X-Large 100 |$ 1000 ($ 1,000.00 | $ 11.89 | $ 1,189.001$ 855 ($ 855.00
D. Long Sleeve T-Shirts - Adult
48|Small — Medium — Large 20 $ 10.00 ($ 200.00 | $ 1189 |$ 23780]% 855($ 171.00
49|X-Large 880 |$ 10.00|$ 8,800.00 | $ 11.89 | $10,463.20 | $ 8.55| $7,524.00
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BID TABULATION

Columbus Trophy and G.E\W,, Inc. d/b{a Wade Linen Promo Solutions
VENDOR NAME: Screenprint Service (Frisco, TX)
(Columbus, GA) (Columbus, GA) ’

Unit Ext Unit Ext Unit Ext

DESCRIPTION Est Qty Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost
50[2X-Large 96 $ 1200 (% 1,152.00 | $ 13.89 | $ 1,33344]1% 9.95([$ 955.20
51|3X-Large 25 $ 13.00 (% 325.00 | $ 1589 |$ 397.25]1% 1055 (% 263.75
Sub-Total| $ 22,352.00| $ 26,875.69| $ 19,498.95

IX. Embroidered Items
A. Golf Shirts — Men’s
52|Small — Medium — Large 20 $ 2200 (% 440.00 | $ 2248 |$ 44960 |$ 17.45(3$ 349.00
53| X-Large 30 $ 2200 (9% 660.00 | $ 2248 |$ 67440]|9% 1745|$ 523.50
54|2X-Large 30 $ 2400 (% 720.00 | $ 2448 |$ 73440]% 1845 |$ 553.50
55|3X- Large 10 $ 26.00 [$ 260.00 | $ 2648 |$ 26480]|% 2045|$ 204.50
56|Hats 84 $ 10.00 ($ 840.00 | $ 16.75 ($ 1,407.00 | $ 12.25| $1,029.00
57|Visors 50 $ 10.00 [$ 500.00 | $ 11.321$ 566.001% 8.85(|$ 44250
B. Jackets
58|Small — Medium — Large 10 $ 4400 |9% 440.00 | $ 4632 ($ 463.20|$ 27.00 | $ 270.00
59|X — Large 15 $ 4400 (3 660.00 | $ 4632 |1$% 694.80]% 27.00 [$ 405.00
60|2X — Large 10 $ 46.00 |$ 460.00 | $ 4832 ($ 483.20|$ 28.00 | $ 280.00
61|3X — Large 5 $ 48.00 ($ 240.00 | $ 5032 |$ 251.60]% 29.00 [$ 145.00
Sub-Total| $ 5,220.00] $ 5,989.00| $ 4,202.00
Sub-Total: T-Shirts| $ 27,572.00| $ 32,864.69]| $ 23,700.95
GRAND TOTAL| $ 102,102.00| $ 136,376.69 | $ 23,700.95
Additional Embroidery Services $10.00 - $15.00 $5.50 - $8.50 $20 - $30
Normal Delivery will be made within 5 Days 15 Days 21 Days
Next Day Delivery, if requested Yes No Yes (add'l fee)
Percent discount for non-listed items 30% 5% 20%
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