
BID TABULATION

Qty.
Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

1  Sizes X-Small to Medium 36 no bid 0.00 23.65 851.40 36.00 1296.00 no bid 0.00

2 Sizes Large to X-Large 12 no bid 0.00 23.65 283.80 46.95 563.40 no bid 0.00

3 Sizes X-Small to Medium 36 no bid 0.00 22.55 811.80 35.05 1261.80 23.00 828.00

4 Sizes Large to X-Large 12 no bid 0.00 22.55 270.60 35.90 430.80 23.00 276.00

5 Sizes X-Small to Medium 36 no bid 0.00 25.99 935.64 39.50 1422.00 35.00 1260.00

6 Sizes Large to X-Large 12 no bid 0.00 25.99 311.88 45.50 546.00 35.00 420.00

7 Sizes X-Small to Medium 36 no bid 0.00 28.99 1043.64 97.50 3510.00 35.00 1260.00

8 Sizes Large to X-Large 12 no bid 0.00 28.99 347.88 97.90 1174.80 35.00 420.00

9 Size 28 2 no bid 0.00 29.55 59.10 41.50 83.00 39.00 78.00

10 Size 30 4 no bid 0.00 29.55 118.20 41.50 166.00 39.00 156.00

11 Size 32 4 no bid 0.00 29.55 118.20 41.25 165.00 39.00 156.00

12 Size 34 4 no bid 0.00 29.55 118.20 41.50 166.00 39.00 156.00

13 Size 36 4 no bid 0.00 29.55 118.20 41.50 166.00 39.00 156.00

14 Size 38 6 no bid 0.00 29.55 177.30 41.50 249.00 39.00 234.00

15 Size 40 6 no bid 0.00 29.55 177.30 41.30 247.80 39.00 234.00

16 Size 42 6 no bid 0.00 29.55 177.30 41.30 247.80 39.00 234.00

17 Sizes X-Small to Medium 36 24.00 864.00 56.30 2026.80 62.25 2241.00 35.00 1260.00

18 Sizes Large to X-Large 12 24.00 288.00 56.30 675.60 65.75 789.00 35.00 420.00

19 Size 28 2 47.00 94.00 62.50 125.00 43.00 86.00 40.00 80.00

Wade Linen Services

(G.E.W. Inc)

(Columbus, GA)

Original Watermen 

Inc

(Vista, CA)

1 
The Lifeguard Store

Adolf Kiefer Associates

(Bloomington, IL)

BSN Sports

(Farmers Branch, TX)

Eagle Creek Capital

(North Salt Lake, UT)

ONE-PIECE; TYR Durafest 

Swim Gear and Lifeguard Accessories 

(Annual Contract)  RFB No. 24-0021

Due: January 31, 2024

SWIM WEAR

BIKINI; TYR Dimaxback Bikini Set

TANKINI; TYR Dimaxback Tankini Set

ONE-PIECE; TYR Guard Dimaxback

BIKINI; TYR Female Guard Ringback Workout Bikini Set

SHORTS, GUARD; TYR 

SHORTS, CHEER; SPEEDO ROLL WAIST

Description

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to award to a
particular contractor. Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project
Manager, who will provide an award recommendation for approval by
Columbus Council.
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BID TABULATION

Qty.
Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Wade Linen Services

(G.E.W. Inc)

(Columbus, GA)

Original Watermen 

Inc

(Vista, CA)

1 
The Lifeguard Store

Adolf Kiefer Associates

(Bloomington, IL)

BSN Sports

(Farmers Branch, TX)

Eagle Creek Capital

(North Salt Lake, UT)

SWIM WEAR

Description

20 Size 30 4 47.00 188.00 62.50 250.00 43.00 172.00 40.00 160.00

21 Size 32 4 47.00 188.00 62.50 250.00 43.00 172.00 40.00 160.00

22 Size 34 4 47.00 188.00 62.50 250.00 43.00 172.00 40.00 160.00

23 Size 36 4 47.00 188.00 62.50 250.00 43.00 172.00 40.00 160.00

24 Size 38 6 47.00 282.00 62.50 375.00 43.50 261.00 40.00 240.00

25 Size 40 6 47.00 282.00 62.50 375.00 43.50 261.00 40.00 240.00

26 Size 42 6 47.00 282.00 62.50 375.00 43.50 261.00 40.00 240.00

27 Sizes X-Small to Medium 20 no bid 0.00 20.49 409.80 70.00 1400.00 25.00 500.00 27.50 550.00

28 Sizes Large to X-Large 20 no bid 0.00 20.49 409.80 70.00 1400.00 25.00 500.00 27.50 550.00

29 Sizes XX-Large 10 no bid 0.00 20.49 204.90 72.50 725.00 28.00 280.00 27.50 275.00

2,844.00$   

30 VISORS; TYR Guard Visor, White 50 no bid 0.00 9.95 497.50 9.78 489.00 no bid 0.00

31 CAPS; TYR Lifeguard Cap, Low Profile, White 50 no bid 0.00 10.95 547.50 13.68 684.00 no bid 0.00

32 WHISTLES; Fox 40 Cushioned Mouth Grip Whistle; Red 75 4.54 340.50 4.10 307.50 6.11 458.25 no bid 0.00

33 LANYARDS; Woven Lifeguard Neck Lanyard, Red/White; 19" 75 2.42 181.50 2.65 198.75 1.95 146.25 no bid 0.00

34 TUBE; 50" Super Rescue Tube, Red 25 48.28 1207.00 49.99 1249.75 70.50 1762.50 no bid 0.00

35 GOGGLES 25 14.52 363.00 11.50 287.50 7.79 194.75 no bid 0.00

36 40' Super Rescue Tube 2 49.78 99.56 43.20 86.40 53.99 107.98 no bid 0.00

37 Prolite Pedi-Lite Spineboard Kit 2 no bid 0.00 187.00 374.00 279.00 558.00 no bid 0.00

38 Rise Plastic Backboard w/Head Immobilizer 2 353.33 706.66 346.69 693.38 449.00 898.00 no bid 0.00

39 Rise Head Immobilizer Complete Kit 2 79.92 159.84 346.69 693.38 112.00 224.00 no bid 0.00

40 UMBRELLA; Solartek, Red 25 94.37 2359.25 111.00 2775.00 123.25 3081.25 no bid 0.00

41 CHAIR; Lifeguard Chair, White 33"L x 29"W x 51"H 25 931.27 23281.75 799.95 19998.75 1049.10 26227.50 no bid 0.00 704.00 17600.00

42 Rope 3/4" diameter; Float Red&White; 100 ft long 75 no bid 0.00 8.25 618.75 495.00 37125.00 no bid 0.00 6.90 517.50

43
Durable Vinyl Industrial Flags; Alternating Colors navy blue and 

gold;  Triangular flags; 11"x18"
2 4.48 8.96 3.89 7.78 69.15 138.30 no bid 0.00 3.50 350.00

44 Stainless Steel Cable 3/16"; 100 ft long 2 1.37 2.74 1.10 2.20 80.00 160.00 no bid 0.00 1.00 100.00

45 1-Color Printed Latex Cap; Blk 2 no bid 0.00 2.40 4.80 11.50 23.00 no bid 0.00

46 Adult/Infant Pocket Mask w/Red Pack Kit 2 10.67 21.34 15.00 30.00 13.05 26.10 no bid 0.00

47 Rise - Aquatics Rip Stop Life Vest Color TBD 2 24.97 49.94 24.00 48.00 35.00 70.00 no bid 0.00

10,268.00$               1,375.00$                       19,807.40$                     11,897.34$                  SUB-TOTAL, SWIM GEAR

LIFEGUARD ACCESSORIES

TRUNKS; TYR Male Guard Area Trunk
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BID TABULATION
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Extended 
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Unit 
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Extended 

Cost
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Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 
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Extended 

Cost

Wade Linen Services

(G.E.W. Inc)

(Columbus, GA)

Original Watermen 

Inc

(Vista, CA)

1 
The Lifeguard Store

Adolf Kiefer Associates

(Bloomington, IL)

BSN Sports

(Farmers Branch, TX)

Eagle Creek Capital

(North Salt Lake, UT)

SWIM WEAR

Description

48 Rise - Aquatics Rip Stop Adult Life Vest 2 24.97 49.94 24.50 49.00 35.00 70.00 no bid 0.00

49 Rubber Dive Brick 2 47.68 95.36 44.75 89.50 52.00 104.00 no bid 0.00

50 Adult Disposable Rsuscitator (BVM) 2 17.92 35.84 16.99 33.98 59.45 118.90 no bid 0.00

51 Pediatric Disposable Rsuscitator (BVM) 2 17.92 35.84 16.99 33.98 37.70 75.40 no bid 0.00

52 Infant Disposable Rsuscitator (BVM) 2 17.92 35.84 16.99 33.98 39.95 79.90 no bid 0.00

53 OSHA/ANSI First Aid Center 2 54.77 109.54 59.99 119.98 492.35 984.70 no bid 0.00

54 Rapid Cold Pack; 24 packs per case 2 27.14 54.28 25.00 50.00 59.97 119.94 no bid 0.00

55 Biohazard Compliance Response Kit 2 12.97 25.94 12.25 24.50 147.30 294.60 no bid 0.00

56 24" Ring Buoy Color: White or Orange 2 89.92 179.84 96.25 192.50 145.25 290.50 no bid 0.00

57 50' Ring Bouy Throw Rope w/Lemon 2 13.32 26.64 11.55 23.10 30.47 60.94 no bid 0.00

58 Dropship: Pal 2.0 Lift 2 9976.87 19953.74 10712.52 21425.04 10997.50 21995.00 no bid 0.00 9156.00 18312.00

59 Dropship: Pool Access Chair, 24" Mesh Seat 425lbs 2 1988.38 3976.76 1737.55 3475.10 2030.00 4060.00 no bid 0.00 1121.00 2242.00

60 Rise - Adult Mask/Infant Pocket Masks 2 7.94 15.88 8.50 17.00 14.59 29.18 no bid 0.00

61 Sunscreen - Tropical Seas Sport, SPF 30, Quart 2 47.97 95.94 41.00 82.00 59.97 119.94 no bid 0.00

62 Marine Buoy Hanger - #803 2 17.92 35.84 25.99 51.98 24.65 49.30 no bid 0.00

63 Adult/Infant Guard Hip Pack 2 15.38 30.76 6.99 13.98 26.09 52.18 no bid 0.00

64 Guard Sunglasses 25 16.68 417.00 15.99 399.75 14.95 373.75 no bid 0.00

65  Cool Gear Quest Guard Bottle 25 12.98 324.50 7.81 195.25 16.95 423.75 no bid 0.00

66 Guard Straw Hat 25 20.87 521.75 22.25 556.25 18.15 453.75 no bid 0.00

67 Dri-Fit Exclusive Guard Long Sleeve Tee 25 no bid 0.00 17.99 449.75 19.06 476.50 no bid 0.00

68 Kim Kevin Kyle Pediatric CPR Manikin 2 551.92 1103.84 597.99 1195.98 655.75 1311.50 no bid 0.00

69 Prestan Infant Manikin 4 Pack w/CPR Monitor 2 670.73 1341.46 188.54 377.08 839.00 1678.00 no bid 0.00

70 Prestan Adult Manikin 4 Pack w/CPR Monitor 2 765.88 1531.76 156.95 313.90 935.20 1870.40 no bid 0.00

71 Water Rider 4 Pool Bike 2 2589.48 5178.96 2043.20 4086.40 2548.04 5096.08 no bid 0.00

72 Kiefer Rock It Boat 2 21.33 42.66 19.20 38.40 24.50 49.00 no bid 0.00

73 Fitball Deluxe Medicine Ball, 12lb. 2 54.93 109.86 63.99 127.98 85.00 170.00 no bid 0.00

74 Fitball Deluxe Medicine Ball, 10lb. 2 47.32 94.64 56.99 113.98 85.00 170.00 no bid 0.00

75 Fitball Deluxe Medicine Ball, 8lb. 2 37.56 75.12 48.99 97.98 85.00 170.00 no bid 0.00

76 Fitball Deluxe Medicine Ball, 6lb. 2 33.22 66.44 42.99 85.98 85.00 170.00 no bid 0.00

77 Fitball Deluxe Medicine Ball, 4lb. 2 25.27 50.54 33.99 67.98 85.00 170.00 no bid 0.00

78 Hydro-Fit Storage System w/Cuffs 2 3232.56 6465.12 2781.85 5563.70 3789.50 7579.00 no bid 0.00 2419.00 4838.00

78 Hydro-Fit Storage Rack Cover 2 145.78 291.56 136.64 273.28 194.45 388.90 no bid 0.00 122.00 244.00
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BID TABULATION
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Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 

Price

Extended 

Cost

Unit 
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Extended 
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Wade Linen Services

(G.E.W. Inc)

(Columbus, GA)

Original Watermen 

Inc

(Vista, CA)

1 
The Lifeguard Store

Adolf Kiefer Associates

(Bloomington, IL)

BSN Sports

(Farmers Branch, TX)

Eagle Creek Capital

(North Salt Lake, UT)

SWIM WEAR

Description

80 Aqua Jogger AquaRunners RX 2 34.98 69.96 35.49 70.98 189.50 379.00 no bid 0.00

81 AquaJogger Active Belt 2 46.97 93.94 47.55 95.10 59.03 118.06 no bid 0.00

82 Aqua Step System 2 139.97 279.94 141.99 283.98 199.00 398.00 no bid 0.00

83 Water Ankle Weights, 3lb. 2 19.97 39.94 19.25 38.50 36.00 72.00 no bid 0.00

84 Water Ankle Weights, 5lb. 2 20.97 41.94 19.25 38.50 44.00 88.00 no bid 0.00

85 Water Ankle Weights, 10lb. 2 27.97 55.94 20.25 40.50 55.00 110.00 no bid 0.00

86 First Aid Cabinets, Small Wall Mount AED Cabinet 5 161.44 807.20 160.00 800.00 396.00 1980.00 no bid 0.00

87 Suitmate Swimsuit Dryer 5 2475.62 12378.10 2194.50 10972.50 3049.25 15246.25 no bid 0.00 2090.00 10450.00

88 Manikin - Adult Water Rescue 2 1230.76 2461.52 1109.84 2219.68 1523.50 3047.00 no bid 0.00

89 Hip Pack/Pocket Mask Combo; Lifeguard Red Water 2 19.38 38.76 19.47 38.94 23.40 46.80 no bid 0.00

DELIVERY WITHIN ________ WEEKS OF ORDER PLACED:

1
 Vendor bid did not inlcude a signed Form 1 - Communication Concerning this Solicitation nor a signed/notarized Form 4 - Conflict of Interest Affidavit.  Both forms are mandatory submission 

requirements. 

-$                          

DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED:

82,678.88$                  142,914.10$                   

___10_%

__4___weeks _____weeks

___ _%

__2.5___weeks

__0__%

__6___weeks

__0 _%

__3___weeks

___5 _%

87,422.47$                 

$93,110.47 $94,576.22 $162,721.50 $10,268.00

SUB-TOTAL, LIFEGUARD ACCESSORIES

TOTAL ESTIMATED COST: $56,028.50
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