
Columbus Consolidated Government BID TABULATION Bid Date: Wed, December 28, 2022

Bid Form (Form 5) and Pricing Page (Page 20)

Contract Signature Page (Form 6)

Insurance Checklist / Certificate of Insurance (Form 7)

Product Literature

               Description

Communication Concerning This Solicitation (Form 1)

Addenda Acknowledgement (Form 2)

Minimum Award Agreement (Form 3)

Minimum Delivery Agreement (Form 4)

X

X

X

X

X

X

X

X

Hauling Hustlers Trucking LLC

(Dallas, GA)

Ferguson Waterworks

(Columbus, GA)

X

X

X

X

X

X

X

X

X

X

Masonry Products (Annual Contract)
RFB No. 23-0024

X

X

Warranty Information

X

X

X

X

Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS)

Sample Invoice

Business License 2022

W-9 Rev 2018

X

X

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent
to award to a particular contractor. Bid responses are being
forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an
award recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.



Columbus Consolidated Government BID TABULATION Bid Date: Wed, December 28, 2022

               Description

Communication Concerning This Solicitation (Form 1) X

Hauling Hustlers Trucking LLC

(Dallas, GA)

Ferguson Waterworks

(Columbus, GA)

X

Masonry Products (Annual Contract)
RFB No. 23-0024

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent
to award to a particular contractor. Bid responses are being
forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an
award recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Quantity Quantity Unit Price
Extended 

Price
Unit Price Extended Price

  1.  Portland Cement, Type I (94 lb bag) 7,200 Bags 11.44 $82,368.00 18.49 $133,128.00

  2.  Cement Mix (40 lb bag) 3,000 Bags No Bid 0 18.99 $56,970.00

  3.  Concrete Ready Mix w/ Gravel (40 lb bag only) 3,000 Bags 4.87 $14,610.00 5.99 $17,970.00

  4.  Brick Sand 30 Tons No Bid 0 53.38 $1,601.50

  5.  Concrete Sand 50 Tons No Bid 0 39.99 $1,999.70

  6.  Sand (Medium Grade Washed River Sand) 500 Tons No Bid 0 43.39 $21,695.00

  7.  Brick, 3 hole common, Grade SW 20,000 Each No Bid 0 .575 $11,500.00

  8.  Brick , 8" Smooth Select Red, Grade SW 20,000 Each No Bid 0 .575 $11,500.00

  9.  Brick, 8" Fire Brick 10,000 Each No Bid 0 4.19 $41,900.00

10.  Concrete Building Brick, Grade "A" SW 20,000 Each No Bid 0 4.09 $81,800.00

11.  Concrete Blocks, Type I, Grade "N" 20,000 Each No Bid 0 4.09 $81,800.00

12.  Mound Mix (Top Dressing) 2 Tons No Bid 0 1850. $3,700.00

TOTAL ANNUAL ESTIMATED COST: $96,978.00 $465,564.20

Discount Percentage for Items Not Listed: 15% 0%

1.  "No Bid" from Acme Brick Company

NOTES:


