RFB NO. 24-0025

BID TABULATION

RFB NAME: Solar-Powered Bus Stop Lights (Annual Contract)

DATE: March 13, 2024

Council.

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award
or intent to award to a particular contractor. Bid
responses are being forwarded to the Project
Manager, who will provide an award
recommendation for approval by Columbus

VENDORS

Gama Sonic USA, Inc.
(Norcross, GA)

Inergy Solutions
(Alpharetta, GA)

Urban Solar
(Beaverton, OR)

Bid Form Pricing Page (Form 1)

v

v

v

GSICA | E-Verify (Form 2): Only required if the vendor is
providing installation services for this bid.

N/A

N/A

Communication Concerning This Solicitation (Form 3)

Federal Compliance (Form 4)

Conflict of Interest Affidavit (Form 5)

SAM.gov (Form 6)

Federal Reporting for ARP funded purchase(s) (From 7)

Federal Clauses (Attachment 1)

Product Literature

Warranty

Addenda (1) - (Form 8)

Contract Signature Page (Form 9)

Business License

W-9
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Solar-Powered Bus Stop Lights

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

{EST. QUANTITY: 500}

$350.00

$175,000.00

$399.00 $199,500.00

$1,239.00 $619,500.00

INSTALLATION COST (OPTIONAL)

NO BID

$150.00 per pole

NO BID

GSICA/E-Verify is only required if vendor is offering installation services.




RFB NO. 24-0025

BID TABULATION

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award
or intent to award to a particular contractor. Bid
responses are being forwarded to the Project
Manager, who will provide an award
recommendation for approval by Columbus

Council.
RFB NAME: Solar-Powered Bus Stop Lights (Annual Contract) ...continued
DATE: March 13, 2024
Regency Supply SELS USALLC GridShift Solar Lighting
VENDORS (Chatsworth, CA) (High Point, NC) (Edmond, OK)
Bid Form Pricing Page (Form 1) v v v
GSICA | E-Verify (Form 2): Only required if the vendor is
providing installation services for this bid. N/A v N/A
Communication Concerning This Solicitation (Form 3) v v v
Federal Compliance (Form 4) v v v
Conflict of Interest Affidavit (Form 5) v v v
SAM.gov (Form 6) v v v
Federal Reporting for ARP funded purchase(s) (From 7) v v v
Federal Clauses (Attachment 1) v v v
Product Literature v v v
Warranty v v v
Addenda (1) - (Form 8) v v v
Contract Signature Page (Form 9) v v v
Business License v SOS for both GA a':]d DE SOS for OK
Statement of Organization
W-9 v v v
Solar-Powered Bus Stop Lights UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
{EST. QUANTITY: 500} $1,420.46 $710,230.00 $1,472.18 $736,090.00 $1,537.00 $768,500.00
$225.00 per /
INSTALLATION COST (OPTIONAL) NO BID $1 12,500.00 total NO BID

GSICA/E-Verify is only required if vendor is offering installation services.




